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Spalding Walk 3

Walk time: ????min
approx

Distance: 3.5miles
approx
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Mixed road and riverbank walking - stout shoes recommended
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Left out of South Holland Centre and left
into Bridge Street. Cross London Road
at traffic lights, over footbridge, turn right
and cross over Churchgate. 

Turn left into The Chestnut Avenue (next
to Ayscoughfee Hall), through
Ayscoughfee gates into Ayscoughfee
Gardens. Out back gate (behind the
tennis courts) turn right and cross over
Love Lane. 

Through the passageway into Lime
Court and left onto Alexandra Road.
Stright over crossroads into Matmore
Gate (Tesco on corner). 

Walk along Matmore Gate and onto dirt
track leading to Coronation Channel. 

Cross over bridge and turn right along
river bank, walk to next bridge. 

Turn left onto dirt road and continue for
approx 100yds to Arnold Smith Meadow
and Nature Reserve on left. 

Retrace steps back to river. Cross bridge
and turn right along river bank (keeping
river on your right) to Low Road bridge -
look out for variety of water birds (and
the water taxi). 

Turn left onto Low Road. 

Turn left at The Hungry Monk Public
House onto Halmergate. 

At the end of Halmergate cross over and
turn right into Church Street and cross
into the churchyard, exit onto The Vista. 

Onto Churchgate turn right to the
footbridge, over bridge and back to
South Holland Centre.

Spalding Walk 3 The Route
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